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Response to DP on Leases 
Dear Rachel, 
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CFA Institute are committed to providing members with a wide range of continuing education 
opportunities. All members are encouraged to undertake ongoing post-qualification 
continuing education. 

In addition, CFA UK is the awarding body for the IMC, the benchmark entry-level 
qualification for those working in investment management in the UK. The examination is 
accredited by the Qualifications and Curriculum Authority (QCA) and is designated a 
recommended examination by the Financial Services Skills Council (FSSC) for the purposes 
of the Financial Services Authority’s training and competence requirements. The IMC is held 
by more than 15,000 investment professionals. 

Feedback on leases 
The committee notes the IASB’s intention to deliver convergence with the FASB on lease 
accounting standards and the 2011 deadline for projects included in the Memorandum of 
Understanding with the FASB. However, the committee is disappointed that the scope of the 
leases project does not include consideration of lessor accounting. In the committee’s view, 
a comprehensive approach to all lease accounting is required and preferred to a 
compromised, albeit improved, approach to lease accounting. The committee notes that the 
failure to review standards for lessees and lessors at the same time could give rise to 
asymmetrical reporting and a situation where a lessee who sub-leases an asset is required 
to apply two different standards to the same assets.  Lessor accounting is a significant 
concern to the committee and the committee does not support the Board’s decision to defer 
consideration of lessor accounting. 

Despite the Board’s failure to consider lessor accounting, the committee welcomes the 
proposed accounting model for lessees observing that it will eliminate the distinction 
between the treatment for operating and financial leases. While the committee believes that 
the investor and analyst community is capable of adjusting statements to recognise 
operating leases, it agrees with the Board that a single, ‘right of use’ approach is preferable. 

In relation to the treatment of leases with options, the committee is concerned that the 
proposed approach provides lessees with too much scope – through their freedom to 
determine the term to be recognised – to control the resulting asset/liability recognised. The 
committee understands the Board’s concern that separate recognition of options and the 
recognition of minimum lease terms enables structuring, but does not believe that the 
proposed approach represents an improvement.  

The committees preferred approach to minimum lease payments and contingent rentals is to 
recognise a liability for which an actual obligation currently exists and disclose the existence 
of contractually agreed but uncommitted obligations or options. In addition, the committee 
believes the treatment of contingent rents should be consistent with the principles in IAS 37.   

The committee has not had sufficient time to consider the remaining questions raised in the 
paper, but it further notes that the Board’s review of IAS 39 should be settled in the near 
future. Would it not be sensible to defer consideration of leases until the project can include 
treatment for both lessees and lessors and when it is possible to refer to the revised 
standards relating to financial instrument recognition and measurement and those for 
revenue recognition and derecognition which also link to leases. 

Yours, 

Jane Fuller, Chair Accounting Advocacy Committe 

 

Will Goodhart, Chief Executive 
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